CITY OF GREAT FALLS MONTANA AGENDA # 16

AGENDA REPORT DATE  September 3, 2002
ITEM: THREE-HUNDRED GALLON REFUSE CONTAINERS
INITIATED BY: PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

ACTION REQUESTED: _ AWARD BID

PRESENTED BY: JM REARDEN, PUBLIC WORKSDIRECTOR

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommendsthat the City Commission award the bid for 270, three-hundred gallon refuse containers
to Solid Waste Systems Inc. of Spokane, WA. for $45,481.50.

MOTION:

| move that the City Commission award the bid for 270, three-hundred gallon refuse containers to Solid
Waste Systems Inc. of Spokane, WA. for $45,481.50.

SYNOPSIS:

The specifications were advertised three times in the Great Fals Tribune and mailed to twenty-seven
prospective bidders. The bids were opened on August 21, 2002 with ten bidders responding.

Bids were requested for both assembled and unassembled containers. User lists were also requested.
Olympic Sales of North Dakota submitted the lowest bid for EI Monte three-hundred gallon refuse
containers. Checking userswith thelist provided by Olympic Sdes, saff discovered the City of Billingshas
experienced a high falure rate and problems with the El Monte container lids. Smilarly our staff has
documented problemswith the El Monte containersthe Sanitation Division purchased in 1998. ThePladtic
Master containers bid by Solid Waste Systems of Spokane require no assembly and have performed well
for the Sanitation Divison inthe past. Userslisted by Solid Waste Systems were also contacted and are
satisfied with Plastic Master containers.

BACKGROUND:

These unitswill be used for resdentid solid waste collections. Fundsfor their purchase were provided in
the FY 2002-03 Sanitation Services Budget.






CITY OF GREAT FALLS

PO BOX 5021

270 NEW 300 GALLONG PLASTIC REFUSE CONTAINERS

GREAT FALLSMT 59403

WITH 2/3HINGED LIDS

Project Number

Bids Taken at Civic Center
Date: August 21, 2002
Tabulated By: Kelly Audet

Page 1 of 1
Bid Security
Affidavit of o
NAME & ADDRESS Non- Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
OF BIDDER Collusion User’sList? | Unassembled | Unassembled | Assembled Assembled | Make/Model
Solid Waste Systems | Submitted two bids — Affidavit of Non-Collusion not notarized on either bid — did not read the bid
Pioneer Equipment NO BID
Western Systems & CC $4,590.00
Fabrication v No $170.00 $45,900.00 $190.00 $51,300.00 RMI — 300 XL
Waste Systems NO BID
300 GALBN
BB 10% Mdl.
RMID W4 v $169.10 $45,657.00 NO BID 06410Blk
El Monte
BB 10% EMP300 2/3
Olympic Sales v v $159.30 $43,011.00 $166.80 $45,036.00 LH
KoisBrothers NO BID
Michagl Bros.,
BB 10% Inc. — MBI
Wasteco M anuf. V4 v $180.65 $48,775.50 $186.65 $50,395.50 300
$46,630.00 El Monte
BB 10% Not Avail. Plastics EMP
Ameritech v v $172.71 w/Hot stamp NO BID 300
Plastic Master
Solid Waste Systems, BB 10% 300 Gal. 2/3
Inc. v v NO BID $168.45 $45,481.50 Lid w/Hatch




NORMONT EQUIPMENT
1157 SMELTER AVENUE
BLACK EAGLE MT 59414

HCL EQUIPMENT
PO BOX 1709
GREAT FALLSMT 59403

KOISBROTHERS EQUIPMENT
PO BOX 1728
GREAT FALLSMT 59403

WESTERN SYSTEMS &
FABRICATION

2403 NORTH UNIVERSITY ROAD

SPOKANE WA 99206

SNYDER INDUSTRIES
PO BOX 4583
LINCOLN NE 68504

WASTCO MANUFACTURING
1435 13TH STREET WEST
DICKINSON ND 58601-3547

ROTONIC MANUF INC
6770 BRIGHTON BLVD

COMMERCE CITY CO 80022-2326

MIDWEST INDUSTRIESINC
2320 NORTH 7TH AVENUE
BOZEMAN MT 59715

MICHAEL BROTHERSINC
PO BOX 3150
CHINOVALLEY AZ 86323-2708

8/29/2002

REFUSE CONTAINERS

BIDDER'SLIST

R.M.1.D.
6770 BRIGHTON BOULEVARD

COMMERCE CITY CO 80022-2326

SOLID WASTE SYSTEMSINC
P.O. BOX 13040
SPOKANE WA 99213-3040

ROTO INDUSTRIES
ATTN KERRY HOLMES
1251 NORTH JEFFERSON
ANAHEIM CA 92807

TOTERINC
PO BOX 5338
STATESVILLENC 28677

PLASTIC MASTERINC

85 DIAMOND AVE

SPRUCE GROVE

ALTA CANADA T7X-3A5

PIONEER EQUIPMENT
PO BOX 3087
BUTTE MT 59702

HOMER CLUCK
POBOX 101
BUSHLAND TX 79012

SDI REFUSE EQUIPMENT INC
PO BOX 1229
VERADALE WA 99037-1229

AMERITECH
PO BOX 2888
CASPER WY 82602-2888

FABCO, INC
PO BOX 5504
HELENA MT 59604-5504

ROCKY MOUNTAIN RECY SYS
PO BOX 1089
CORVALLISMT 59828

OLYMPIC SALES
GREGG KRUTSINGER
PO BOX 5701
FARGOND 58105

PERFORMANCE SUPPLY
PO BOX 569
BLACK EAGLEMT 59414

WASTE SYSTEMS
2307 120™ STREET
LUBBOCK TX 79423

NATIONAL GENERAL SUPINC
1015 1% AVENUE NORTH

PO BOX 2288

GREAT FALLSMT 59403

SOLID WASTE SYSTEMS
7855 LARK DRIVE
PARKER CO 80138

WESTERN STAR/STERLING OF MT
1430 CARTER DRIVE
HELENA MT 59601

WASTEQUIP MAY MFG
5400 MARSHALL STREET
ARVADA CO 80002



